

ATTACHMENT TO TAX INVOICE

Attention: Mark Englebert
 FTI Consulting Australia Pty Ltd
 Level 6 BNZ House
 30 The Esplanade
 PERTH WA 6000
 AUSTRALIA

Proof Bankwest fully aware of false statement - Senate hearing made to

Date 31 October 2012
 Invoice No 1417284
 Our Ref RMJ:LDA/45-7534619

Date	Initials	Narration	Time (hours)	Rate /hour	Australian Dollars Total
09/10/12	JAK1	Attending meeting with Counsel, Mark Englebert and Jeremy Nipps to finalise position prior to hearing	0.8	375	300.00
09/10/12	JAK1	Correspondence to and from Tim Bryant of the Senate Committee regarding final submissions; arranging issue of written submissions; providing copy of final submissions to Counsel	1.0	375	375.00
09/10/12	JAK1	Preparing draft opening statement for Senate hearing; preparing additional documents for provision to Counsel; researching examples of contempt for breach of parliamentary privilege	2.9	375	1,087.50
09/10/12	LDA	Attending to matters with Canberra office	0.4	660	264.00
09/10/12	LDA	Attending to statement	1.5	660	990.00
09/10/12	LDA	Conference with Jon Karolczak regarding matters arising from meeting	0.3	660	198.00
09/10/12	LDA	Meeting with Counsel, Mark Engleberg and Jeremy Nipps	1.2	660	792.00
09/10/12	LDA	Reviewing opening statement and conferral with Jon Karolczak in relation to the opening statement	0.5	660	330.00
10/10/12	JAK1	Reviewing documents prior to Senate Hearing; attendance at Senate Hearing	5.0	375	1,875.00
10/10/12	LDA	Attending Senate hearing <i>NOTE</i>	2.0	660	1,320.00
10/10/12	LDA	Preparing for Senate hearing	2.5	660	1,650.00
11/10/12	SRA	Reviewing parliamentary website in relation to Senators in attendance at private hearing on 10 October 2012; email to Leith Ayres; telephone conversation with Tim Bryant (secretary of Committee) to confirm position; advising Leith Ayres by email of position	0.4	375	150.00
15/10/12	JAK1	<u>Preparing summary of hearing for David Nolan; preparing file copy of notes regarding 'in camera' part of hearing</u>	1.5	375	562.50
15/10/12	LDA	Conference with Jon Karolczak	0.2	660	132.00
15/10/12	LDA	Drafting report re Senate hearing	0.2	660	132.00
15/10/12	LDA	<u>Email to David Nolan on Senate appearance</u>	0.2	660	132.00
16/10/12	JAK1	Receiving and considering in camera transcript; preparing list of questions to be responded to on notice	0.5	375	187.50
18/10/12	JAK1	Reviewing Senate Hansard and preparing response to questions on notice	1.2	375	450.00
18/10/12	LDA	Reading Hansard	0.5	660	330.00

After the hearing so Bankwest fully aware of what was said