

ATTACHMENT TO TAX INVOICE

Attention: Mark Englebert
 FTI Consulting Australia Pty Ltd
 Level 6 BNP House
 30 The Esplanade
 PERTH WA 6000
 AUSTRALIA

Date 31 October 2012
 Invoice No 1417284
 Our Ref RMJ:LDA/45-7534619

*Proof that Bankwest
 were aware of what
 was going on*

Date	Initials	Narration	Time (hours)	Australian Dollars	
				Rate /hour	Total
04/10/12	JAK1	Preparing synthesised folder of documents; writing letter to Counsel regarding document folders for brief	2.0	375	750.00
04/10/12	JAK1	Telephone conference with Counsel and Leith Ayres regarding matters to be addressed in written submissions	0.9	375	337.50
04/10/12	LDA	Telephone conversation with Counsel and Jon Karolczak	0.9	660	594.00
05/10/12	JAK1	<u>Meeting with Counsel, David Nolan of BankWest and Mark Englebert regarding Senate Inquiry hearing</u>	2.4	375	900.00
05/10/12	JAK1	Preparing additional brief documents on request from Counsel (<u>namely submissions to the Senate Inquiry by Bankwest, CBA, etc</u>)	0.7	375	262.50
05/10/12	JAK1	Reviewing and amending written submissions; meeting with Leith Ayres to discuss amendments to submissions; reviewing documents to collate accompanying documents for submissions; preparing collated documents to accompany submissions	8.0	375	3,000.00
05/10/12	LDA	Meeting with Counsel, Mark Englebert, Jeremy Nipps, Jon Karolczak and David Nolan regarding Senate Inquiry	2.4	660	1,584.00
05/10/12	LDA	Telephone calls with Counsel regarding content of submissions	0.4	660	264.00
05/10/12	LDA	Telephone conferences with Counsel; reviewing and amending submissions to Senate Inquiry	1.6	660	1,056.00
05/10/12	RMJ	<u>Engaged on considering and responding to email from David Nolan in relation to attendance in chambers</u>	0.1	580	58.00
06/10/12	JAK1	Finalising revised draft of submissions following meeting with Counsel; preparing copies of accompanying documents	4.0	375	1,500.00
08/10/12	JAK1	Preparing amendments to Senate submission to respond to further issues raised by Sean Butler	1.3	375	487.50
08/10/12	JAK1	Telephone conference with Mark Englebert and Jeremy Nipps to finalise submissions; preparing amended submissions; forwarding to Mark Englebert and Jeremy Nipps for review	2.2	375	825.00
08/10/12	LDA	Attending further to submission and matter arising	1.4	660	924.00
08/10/12	LDA	Conference with Richard Johnson regarding submissions	0.2	660	132.00
08/10/12	LDA	Reviewing final submissions	0.6	660	396.00
08/10/12	LDA	Telephone conversation with Brahma Dharmananda regarding response to Mr Butlers recent e-mails	0.2	660	132.00
08/10/12	LDA	Telephone conversation with Mark Englebert and Jeremy Nipps regarding further amendments to submissions	0.5	660	330.00

TIME NARRATION REPORT BY DATE PAGE 2 OF 5